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Israeli Tech Leader Hillel Fuld Inspires Hillel
Academy Middle School Students
Hillel Academy’s Wuligar Middle School recently
hosted Hillel Fuld, a renowned Israeli
entrepreneur and content creator, for an
engaging and inspiring discussion with Middle
School students.

Fuld, who has collaborated with global
powerhouses such as Google, Oracle, Microsoft,
and Nike, captivated students with insights into
entrepreneurship, social media, and the evolving
world of technology. Speaking in the Middle
School Mercaz, he shared personal experiences
from his journey in the tech industry, offering
valuable lessons on innovation, resilience, and
the impact of digital platforms.

“Our students were energized by Hillel Fuld’s
passion and knowledge,” said Julie Begani. “His
real-world experiences and advice provided
them with a unique perspective on the
opportunities that exist in the tech and
entrepreneurial world.”
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Hillel Academy remains committed to bringing
thought leaders and industry experts to inspire
the next generation, ensuring students are
prepared for a future of innovation and success.

For more information about Hillel Academy,
please contact,Stephanie Samueli, Director of
Admissions, at
admissions@hillelacademytampa.com
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